
 

 

Public 

NOT FOR RELEASE, DISTRIBUTION OR PUBLICATION, IN WHOLE OR IN PART, 
DIRECTLY OR INDIRECTLY, IN OR INTO THE UNITED STATES OF AMERICA, 

AUSTRALIA, JAPAN, SWITZERLAND, CANADA, SOUTH AFRICA, UNITED ARAB 
EMIRATES, DUBAI INTERNATIONAL FINANCIAL CENTRE, QATAR, SINGAPORE, 

KUWAIT, BRAZIL OR IN ANY JURISDICTION IN WHICH RELEASE, DISTRIBUTION 
OR PUBLICATION WOULD BE UNLAWFUL 

 
 

 

 
 

 

 

 

ANNOUNCEMENT ON THE SHARE CAPITAL INCREASE 

 

Regarding the Cash Increase of "INTRALOT S.A. - INTEGRATED LOTTERY SYSTEMS 
AND SERVICES" (the Company) and the combined offering of not less than 
350,000,000 or more than 450,000,000 newly, common, registered, dematerialized, 
voting shares to be listed on the Regulated Market of the Athens Exchange, with a 
nominal value of €0.30 each (the “Offer Shares”) in the share capital of the Company 
 

Peania, October 3, 2025 
 
In accordance with the provisions of Regulation (EU) 2017/1129 and further to its 
announcements published on September 30, 2025, October 1, 2025, and October 2, 
2025, the Company announces today that, in view of the strong demand expressed so far 
in the context of the bookbuilding for the Institutional Offering, it is informing investors 
participating in the Institutional Offering that bids below the amount of one euro and ten 
cents (€1.10) per Offer Share will most likely not be considered for allocation of Offer 
Shares. The Offering Price in the Institutional Offering and the Greek Public Offering will 
be identical. 
 
 
Capitalized terms used herein shall have the same meaning ascribed to them in the 
previous referenced announcements. 
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Important Regulatory Notice 
  
This announcement constitutes a public disclosure of inside information by the Company 
under Article 17(1) of Regulation (EU) No 596/2014. 
 
There can be no assurance that the offering will be completed or, if completed, as to the 
terms on which it will be completed. 
 
This announcement does not constitute an offer to sell or the solicitation of an offer to 
buy any Offer Shares, nor will there be any sale of Offer Shares referred to in this 
announcement, in any jurisdiction, including the United States, in which such offer, 
solicitation or sale is not permitted. The Offer Shares have not been registered under the 
U.S. Securities Act of 1933, as amended (the “U.S. Securities Act”), and may not be 
offered or sold in the United States absent registration under the U.S. Securities Act or an 
applicable exemption from the registration requirements of the U.S. Securities Act.  
  
It may be unlawful to distribute these materials in certain jurisdictions. These materials 
are not for distribution in Australia, Japan, Switzerland, Canada, South Africa, United Arab 
Emirates, Dubai International Financial Centre, Qatar, Singapore, Kuwait, Brazil or the 
United States of America. The information in these materials does not constitute an offer 
of securities for sale in Australia, Japan, Switzerland, Canada, South Africa, United Arab 
Emirates, Dubai International Financial Centre, Qatar, Singapore, Kuwait, Brazil or the 
United States of America. 
 
This announcement has been prepared on the basis that any offer of the Offer Shares in 
any Member State of the European Economic Area (“EEA”) (each, a “Relevant Member 
State”), other than in Greece, will be made pursuant to an exemption under Regulation 
(EU) 2017/1129 (the “Prospectus Regulation”) from the requirement to publish a 
prospectus for offers of the Offer Shares. Accordingly, any person making or intending to 
make any offer in that Relevant Member State, other than in Greece, of the Offer Shares 
which are the subject of the offering contemplated in this document may only do so in 
circumstances in which no obligation arises for the Company or any of the managers with 
respect to such securities to publish a prospectus pursuant to Article 3 of the Prospectus 
Regulation or supplement a prospectus pursuant to Article 16 of the Prospectus 
Regulation, in each case, in relation to such offer. Neither the Company nor the managers 
with respect to such securities have authorized, nor do they authorize, the making of any 
offer of securities in circumstances in which an obligation arises for the Company or any 
managers of such securities to publish or supplement a prospectus for such offer. 
 
This announcement is only being distributed to, and is only directed at, persons in the 
United Kingdom that are “qualified investors” within the meaning of Article 2(e) of the 
Prospectus Regulation and that also (i) are “investment professionals” falling within 
Article 19(5) of the Financial Services and Markets Act 2000 (Financial Promotion) Order 
2005 (as amended, the “Order”), (ii) are persons falling within Article 49(2)(a) to (d) (high 
net worth companies, unincorporated associations, etc.) of the Order, or (iii) are persons 
to whom it may otherwise be lawfully communicated or otherwise in circumstances 
which have not resulted and will not result in an offer to the public of the shares in the 
United Kingdom within the meaning of the Financial Services and Markets Act 2000 (all 
such persons together being referred to as “relevant persons”). This announcement is 
directed only at relevant persons and must not be acted on or relied on by persons who 
are not relevant persons. Any investment or investment activity to which this 
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announcement relates is available only to relevant persons and will be engaged in only 
with relevant persons. 
 
MiFID II (ECPs and Professional Clients only): Manufacturer target market (MiFID II 
product governance) is high net worth retail investors, professional investors and eligible 
counterparties target market (all distribution channels). No PRIIPs key information 
document (KID) has been prepared as the securities are not available to any retail investor 
in the EEA (other than in line with the target market). 
 
Each of the managers and any of their respective nominated affiliates are acting for the 
Company and no one else in connection with any potential offering of securities of the 
Company and will not be responsible to any other person for providing the protections 
afforded to their respective clients, or for providing advice in relation to any potential 
offering of securities of the Company. No person viewing this announcement shall be 
deemed to be a client of the managers for any purpose. 
 
 


